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| Report No.: 08-337
TO: Mayor and Council
FROM: Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer
RESOURCE STAFF: Sheila Kidd, Director of Organizational Effectiveness
DATE OF MEETING: 2008-11-04
SUBJECT: By-Law Amendment - By-Law No. 2002-86, “A By-Law to Establish the
Position of Chief Administrative Officer”

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY:

The purpose of this report is to seek approval to apply the amended process for conducting a 360 degree evaluation to the
commissioner positions and to amend the CAO by-Law to reflect this change.

RECOMMENDATION:

That by-law no. 2002-86, “A By-Law to Establish the Position of Chief Administrative Officer’ be amended to apply the recently
adopted process for documenting the development requirements of the CAQ, to the commissioner positions.

AUTHORIZING SIGNATURES:

ORIGINAL SIGNED BY CHIEF ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER

Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer

CONSULTATION WITH THE FOLLOWING COMMISSIONERS:

Commissioner Beach, Sustainability & Growth N/R
Commissioner Thurston, Community Development Services N/R
Commissioner Leger, Corporate Services N/R
Jim Keech, President, Utilities Kingston N/R

OPTIONS/DISCUSSION:



COUNCIL MEETING2 2NOV - 4 08

REPORT TO COUNCIL. Report No.: 08-337
November 4, 2008
-Page2 -

Amendments to the CAO by-law were approved by council on June 17, 2008. The by-law, as presented, incorporated changes
that were developed and recommended by the CAO Job Evaluation Ad Hoc Committee. Clause 2, section 3 of the by-law
addresses the requirement and the process for conducting a 360 degree evaluation for the CAO and the commissioner
positions. The commitiee recommendation was to apply the new process to the CAO position and inadvertently failed to
recommend the same process should be applied to the commissioner positions.

NOTICE PROVISIONS:
N/A

ACCESSIBILITY CONSIDERATIONS:
N/A

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:
N/A

CONTACTS:
N/A

OTHER CITY OF KINGSTON STAFF CONSULTED:
N/A

EXHIBITS ATTACHED:
Appendix A — Draft By-Law to Establish the Position of Chief Administrative Officer



COUNTL &eeTing2 2NV - 08

Report 08-337
Appendix A

BY-LAW NO. 2008-XXX

A BY-LAW TO AMEND BY-LAW NO. 2002-86 “A BY-LAW TO ESTABLISH THE POSITION OF CHIEF
ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER” (To add the commissioners to the requirement for an annual 360
degree evaluation for performance evaluation of the CAO, and to include a 360 degree evaluation
criteria to assess leadership behaviors and style for development purposes)

PASSED:

The Council of The Corporation of the City of Kingston hereby enacts as follows:

1. By-Law No. 2002-86 of The Corporation of the City of Kingston entitied, “A By-Law To Establish
The Position Of Chief Administrative Officer”, as amended, is hereby further amended as follows:

1.1, Section 3, clause (4) is hereby amended by deleting the entire section and replacing it with the
following:

(4) ‘A 360 Degree Evaluation of the commissioners shall be conducted once every two years in order to
assess leadership behaviours and style for development purposes. The following process is to be followed:

a) In May, or at another time that is distinct from the performance review, of every second year, the
Chief Administrative Officer shall initiate a 360 Degree Feedback exercise based on the
commissioner competencies in the commissioner job profile.

b) The results of the 360 degree Feedback shall be shared with council. The Chief Admiinstrative
Officer shall solicit input to any development plans that should be negotiated with the
commissioner as part of histher ongoing professional development.

¢) The results of the 360 Degree Feedback are not normally achievement oriented and therefore are
not appropriate for use in the Pay for Performance exercise. They are, however, very useful for
the development of the commissioner and may suggest clear areas of training or learning required
to enable the commissioner to reach the maximum degree of competence in all areas of the job.
Following the completion of the appraisal of the commissioner, the Chief Administrative Officer will
report to council for information purposes on the merit increase and the annual evaluations.”

2. This by-law shall come into force and take effect on the date of its passing
GIVEN FIRST AND SECOND READINGS
GIVEN THIRD READING AND FINALLY PASSED

CITY CLERK : MAYOR
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[ Report No.: 08-340

TO: | Mayor & Council
FROM: Denis Leger, Commissioner, Corporate Services
RESOURCE STAFF: Speros Kanellos, Director, Growth & Initiatives Department
DATE OF MEETING: 2008-11-04
SUBJECT: AWARD OF TENDER - F18-CS-CO 2008-01

Steel Ladder Replacement and Pavement Repairs

For the Crawford Wharf
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY:

Two bids were received for Tender No. F18 CS-CO 2008-01 Steel Ladder Replacement and Pavement Repairs for
the Crawford Wharf. In accordance with the City's Purchasing Policy, Council's approval to secure budget and to
award is required as it is an unbudgeted expense and as less than three (3) bids were received.

RECOMMENDATION:

THAT Council approve an amendment to the 2008 capital budget in the amount of $130,000 with funding from both
the Crawford Wharf Reserve Fund ($103,000) and the Municipal Capital Reserve Fund ($27,000), to carry out the
design and building works for the replacement of steel ladders and remedial pavement repairs on the Crawford
Whart, and :

THAT the tender bid of H.R. Doornekamp Construction Ltd, for Tender No. F18-CS-CO 2008-01 Steel Ladder
Replacement and Pavement Repairs for the Crawford Wharf, in the amount of $113,140.00 (excluding GST), be
accepted, it being the lowest tender received.
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AUTHORIZING SIGNATURES:

ORIGINAL SIGNED BY COMMISSIONER

Denis Leger, Commissioner, Corporate Services

ORIGINAL SIGNED BY CHIEF ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICER

Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer

CONSULTATION WITH THE FOLLOWING COMMISSIONERS:

Commissioner Beach, Sustainability & Growth 4
Commissioner Hunt, Finance & Corporate Performance v
Commissioner Thurston, Community Development Services N/R
Commissioner Leger, Corporate Services

Jim Keech, President, Utilities Kingston N/R
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OPTIONS/DISCUSSION:

During the Fall of 2007, a condition assessment of the Crawford Wharf was conducted by De Curtis Engineering
Limited. De Curtis’ report summarized a list of safety related remedial repairs along with capital and operating
maintenance plans for the Crawford Wharf. The concern to enhance public safety on the wharf needs to be acted
upon and involves the removal and installation of new steel ladders along the seawall and repair of three sinkholes
within the footprint of the Crawford Wharf.

In turn, De Curtis was further retained for $14,650 plus GST on August 20, 2008 for the preparation of design
drawings and specifications for ladder replacement and sinkhole repairs at the Crawford Wharf. These documents
were then added to the City's Tender No. F18 CS CO 2008 01 for “Steel Ladder Replacement and Pavement Repairs
for the Crawford Wharf” which was advertised on September 29, 2008. Due to the nature of the identified
deficiencies, staff proceeded to obtain competitive quotes on the remediation costs through a competitive process
rather than delay to the 2009 budget process. ’

On Wednesday, October 15, 2008, bids for Tender F18-CS-CO 2008-01 were received as follows (prices exclude
GST):

H.R. Do'ornekamp Construction Ltd. $113,140.00
Limen Group Const. Ltd. $138,700.00

Since only two bids were received, Council’s approval is required to award this work to the lowest bidder. Staff are
confident that H.R. Doornekamp’s bid of $113,140.00 represents good value. H.R. Doornekamp Construction Ltd. is
a reputable Contractor and has completed similar contracts for the City in the past including the installation of steel
bollards and fenders at the Marine Museum in late 2007.

EXISTING POLICY/BY LAW:

The delegated authority provisions of the purchasing by-law for awarding tenders require that the purchasing by-law
has been complied with, there is sufficient budget and that at least three bids have been received. In this case, there
has been no formal budget approval and only two bids were received. Accordingly, Council approval is required to
provide for the budget and to award the work. Council awards the tender to the lowest bidder unless there is sufficient
reason to do otherwise.

NOTICE PROVISIONS:
There are no notice provisions with this report.

ACCESSIBILITY CONSIDERATIONS:
There are no accessibility considerations with this report.

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:

When the Federal Government turned over ownership of the Crawford Wharf to the City in 2001, the City received
approximately $100,000 to be used to maintain the Wharf. There were some repairs which were paid for using a
portion of these funds. A further contribution was made as well as interest accruing which now amounts to
$103,319.79 in the Crawford Wharf Reserve Fund. The ladder and sinkhole repair works qualify as eligible expenses
under the agreement with the Federal Government.
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The majority of the costs for the tender works can be paid from the Crawford Wharf Reserve Fund (approximately
$103,000) and an additional amount of approximately $27,000 is required from the Municipal Capital Reserve Fund
to complete the funding. The summation of the design costs from De Curtis ($15,000) and Doornekamp ($113,000)
with a small contingency for site review by the Consultant amounts to $130,000 plus GST.

CONTACTS:
Speros Kanellos, P. Eng., Director, Growth & Initiatives Department, ext. 3133

OTHER CITY OF KINGSTON STAFF CONSULTED:
Cynthia Beach, Commissioner, Sustainability & Growth Group

EXHIBITS ATTACHED:
N/A
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|  ReportNo.: 08-336 |
TO: Mayor and Council
- FROM: Denis Leger, Commissioner of Corporate Services
RESOURCE STAFF: David Mignault, Research and Grants Coordinator
DATE OF MEETING: 2008-11-04
SUBJECT: Springer Market Square Revitalization Project - RED Funding
Agreement
EXECUTIVE SUMMARY:

This report seeks a Council by-law authorizing the municipality to enter into agreement with the province under the
Rural Economic Development (RED) program in order to receive funding for the Springer Market Square
Revitalization project.

On August 27, 2008, the Honourable Leona Dombrowsky, Minister of Agriculture, Food and Rural Affairs, Province of
Ontario, informed the City of Kingston that its application requesting funding for the Springer Market Square
Revitalization project was conditionally approved under the RED program.

The Ministry has approved the application and conditionally agreed to fund up to $450,000 towards the project. This
funding is subject to the execution of the RED Project Agreement between the Government of Ontario and the City of
Kingston, and a Municipal By-law allowing the municipality to enter into an Agreement with the Province of Ontario.

This report further recommends that three readings of the by-law be given at this Council meeting due to the fact that
the province is requesting to receive the authorizing by-law and signed agreement before November 7, 2008.

RECOMMENDATION:

THAT a By-Law be presented to Council to authorize the Mayor and City Clerk to enter into an agreement with the
province regarding the Rural Economic Development contribution for the Springer Market Square Revitalization
project, in a form satisfactory to the Director of Legal Services;

‘ -and further-
THAT the By-Law receive all three readings.
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AUTHORIZING SIGNATURES:

ORIGINAL SIGNED BY COMMISSIONER

Denis Leger, Commissioner of Corporate Services

_ORJﬁINALSlGNE[LBﬂJﬂEEADMlNISTRAﬂVE OFFICER

Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer

CONSULTATION WITH THE FOLLOWING COMMISSIONERS:

Commissioner Beach, Sustainability & Growth N/R
Commissioner Hunt, Finance & Corporate Performance N/R
Commissioner Thurston, Community Development Services N/R
Commissioner Leger, Corporate Services v©
Jim Keech, President, Utilities Kingston N/R

(N/R indicates consultation not required)
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OPTIONS/DISCUSSION:

The City of'Kingston in partnership with Downtown Kingston! Business Improvement Area applied to the Rural
Economic Development (RED) program for funding for the Springer Market Square Revitalization project as per
Council resolution from February 19, 2008, that stated:

THAT Council approve that an application be submitted to the Province of Ontario’s Rural Economic
Development (RED) Program for the reconfiguration of the interior washrooms and change rooms in the
Market Square basement wing of City Hall to complement the Market Square Revitalization Project work as a
community (downtown) revitalization priority.

The application was approved and Downtown Kingston! Business Improvement Area and the City of Kingston are
eligible to receive funding of up to $450,000 for the project.

The RED Program is a community development initiative that helps communities remove barriers to community
development and economic growth and develop the tools and flexibility they need to become strong communities.
Eligible applicants include strategic alliances between (any combination of) individuals, businesses, community
organizations (including not-for-profity and municipalities with an arm’s length relationship from each other.
Municipalities, individuals or individual businesses are not eligible to apply as sole applicants. As such, the City of
Kingston partnered with the Downtown Kingston! Business Improvement Area to apply for funding under this
program.

Now in its final phase, this Springer Market Square Revitalization project has renovated and restored Springer Market
Square — allowing it not only to host the 206-year-old Kingston Market, but to be utilized as a year-round venue for
concerts, civic celebrations, movies and a variety of other celebrated regional outdoor events. A new artificial outdoor
rink operates each year from November to April. When the ice is removed in the spring, the entire surface area
becomes available for market vendors and numerous arts, cultural and other community events.

The final phase of the project focuses on making the Square fully accessible through renovating the washrooms and
change rooms located in the basement of historic City Hall - adjacent to the Square. In essence the project will see
the renovation and conversion of the former Parking Operations office area and public washrooms on the lower level
of the Market Wing of Kingston City Hall to provide enlarged and fully accessible public washrooms, change facilities,
green room and storage space for the Springer Market Square.

Social participation and engagement is fundamental to the health of Kingston and eastern Ontario. Canadians with
disabilities and accessibility issues experience a number of barriers to their full participation in everyday life activities.
The renovations in this project will level the playing field by enabling people with accessibility issues to develop their
skills and abilities while renewing the look and feel of the entire downtown core. The business and tourism
opportunities that come with the implementation of this project will create a vibrant and progressive community and
region.

Springer Market Square currently is deficient in the accessibility area. For example, change rooms are required for
the free outdoor skating rink that is used by thousands from eastern Ontario each late fall, winter and early spring.
The change rooms also provide dressing facilities intended to support performers using the new outdoor .

P
sy
R O
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amphitheatre recently constructed on the south side of the Market Wing. Moreover, the fully accessible washrooms
will act as a first step toward working with the community to remove barriers that hinder the participation of all people
in the life of our community.

Moreover, the funding via the RED program ensures tourists and visitors will be welcomed with new portable fumiture
- chairs and tables for people gathering and resting and complementary benches, planters and canopy — all
respecting the heritage vision of the Square.

This additional work will complement the many activities that take place at Springer Market Square. The project is a
collaborative vision and effort between the Corporation of the City of Kingston, the Downtown Kingston! Business
Improvement Association and the community — with a number of stakeholders. :

The final phase of this project has been budgeted at $900,000. The RED program will fund up to 50% of these costs.
Downtown Kingston! Business Improvement Area has committed to providing over $50,000 in direct marketing
services for events at Springer Market Square.

EXISTING POLICY/BY LAW:
There is no existing policy/by-law.

NOTICE PROVISIONS:
There are no notice provisions.

ACCESSIBILITY CONSIDERATIONS:

The project will see the renovation and conversion of the former Parking Operations office area and public
washrooms on the lower level of the Market Wing of Kingston City Hall to provide enlarged and fully accessible public
washrooms, change facilities, green room and storage space for the Springer Market Square.

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:

Council has approved a final phase and separate budget for the reconfiguration/renovation of the basement of the
Springer Market Square wing of City Hall to build fully accessible public washrooms and Change Rooms to
complement the increased activity in Springer Market Square.

To fund the renovation work of this final phase as well as complementary Square furniture will require an investment -
of $900,000. The RED program will help fund $450,000 (not representing more than 50% of the overall project costs)
of this project to help ensure the success of this initiative. Sufficient funds have been approved in previous and
current years' budgets for the City’s contribution to the overall project.

CONTACTS: :
David Mignault, Research and Grants Coordinator, 613-546-4291, Ext. 3187

OTHER CITY OF KINGSTON STAFF CONSULTED:
Yvonne Holland, Manager, Facilities

EXHIBITS ATTACHED:
Draft by-law

ik
-
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Exhibit A
Draft By-Law
BY-LAW NO. 2008-XX

A BY-LAW TO AUTHORIZE THE MAYOR AND CITY OF KINGSTON CLERK TO EXECUTE THE “RED (RED:
RURAL ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT RE: CONTRIBUTION FOR THE SPRINGER MARKET SQUARE
REVITALIZATION PROJECT) PROGRAM FUNDING AGREEMENT” WITH THE GOVERNMENT OF ONTARIO

- PASSED: November 4, 2008

The Council of the Corporation of the City of Kingston enacts as follows:

WHEREAS the Agreement requires the City of Kingston to pass a municipal by-law designating the signing
authorities and authorizing the municipality to enter into an agreement with the Government of Ontario:

NOW THEREFORE the Council of the City enacts as follows;

1. That the Mayor and City Clerk are designated as the signing authormes and authorizing the municipality to
enter into an agreement with the Province of Ontario.

2. This by-law shall come into force and take effect the day it was passed.

GIVEN ALL THREE READINGS AND PASSED

CITY CLERK MAYOR

rd
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| Report No.: 08-347 |
TO: ‘ ' Mayor and Council
FROM: Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer
RESOURCE STAFF: Janis Morrison, Purchasing Coordinator
DATE OF MEETING: © 2008-11-04
SUBJECT: Award of Tender No. L04-FCP-FIN 2008-3 Winter Control for
Municipal Parking Lots, Buildings and Facilities

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY:

The purpose of this report is to award the components of Tender No. L04-FCP-FIN 2008-3, Winter Control for Municipal Parking
Lots, Buildings and Facilities, that do not meet the criteria for delegated authority because three bids were not received. The
remaining components will be reported in the October delegated authority report.

RECOMMENDATION:

1. That council approve the following award recommendations based on acceptance of the lowest bid received as indicated in

Schedule A. .
Appendix A, Part One - Municipal Parking Lots to J. Harrison Excavating and Pipeline Limited

Appendix B, Part Two (A) Buildings and Properties to J. Harrison

o Transit Building 1811 John Counter Blvd., Court House, 4 Court Street, Grand Theatre, 218 Princess Street and

Kingston Area Recycling Centre, 196 Lappan’s Lane

Appendix B, Part Two (A) Buildings and Properties to GLE Excavation
o Unity Road, Fire Hall # 8 and Hwy 38, Fire Hall # 9

Appendix B, Part Two (A) Buildings and Properties to Sharpe Lawn & Garden Service Limited
o Fire Hall # 2, Brewers Mills Road and Woodburn Community Centre,

Appendix B, Part Two (A) Buildings and Properties to Bayridge Lawns & Landscaping
e Pump House Steam Museum, 23 Ontario Street

Appendix B, Part Two (A) Buildings and Properties to Zomer and Sons Landscaping and Contracting Limited

o Utility Building, 1211 John Counter Blvd., Water Treatment Plant, 623 King Street, Kingston East Landfill Site,

MacLachlan Woodworking Museum and the Kingston Memorial Centre, York Street

2. That the mayor ‘and clerk be authorized to sign contract agreements in a form satisfactory to Legal Services with the

companies recommended above.
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AUTHORIZING SIGNATURES:

ORIGIVAL SIGNED B CHEF ADMINISTRATIVEOFFCER

Gerard Hunt, Chief Administrative Officer

CONSULTATION WITH THE FOLLOWING COMMISSIONERS:

Commissioner Beach, Sustainability & Growth N/R

Commissioner Thurston, Community Development Services

Commissioner Leger, Corporate Services

NI

Jim Keech, President, Utilities Kingston

OPTIONS/DISCUSSION:

This proposal was publicly advertised on the city website. All of the recommended companies have previously provided similar
services for the City of Kingston with satisfactory results. The term of these contracts will commence with the first snow fall of
2008 and end on April 30, 2009 with the option of one further renewal period for the 2009/10 season.

EXISTING POLICY/BY LAW:

Purchasing By-Law 2000-134, as amended.
By-Law No. 98-1, Council Procedure By-Law, which provides authority for the mayor and clerk to sign all agreements that are
approved by council.

NOTICE PROVISIONS:
Not applicable.

ACCESSIBILITY CONSIDERATIONS:
Not applicable.

FINANCIAL CONSIDERATIONS:

The lowest bid is recommended for each component. Winter control costs are projected as part of the annual operating budget.
CONTACTS:

(Those to whom copies of the report will be circulated.)

Janis Morrison, Purchasing Coordinator 613-546-4291, Ext 2229

Jamie Brash, Supervisor Facilities Maintenance 613-546-4291, Ext 1291

Tara Perry, Administrative Assistant 613-548-4001, Ext 5204

Sam Tulk, Supervisor Parking Services 613-546-4291, Ext 1379

John Rhodes, Supervisor Solid Waste ‘ 613-546-4291, Ext 2702

Brian McCurdy, Manager Culture and Recreation 613-546-4291, Ext 1354
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OTHER CITY OF KINGSTON STAFF CONSULTED:
(Staff who were consulted for purposes of preparing the report.)

Commissioner Beach, Sustainability and Growth
Commissioner Thurston, Community Development Services
Commissioner Leger, Corporate Services

Jim Keech, President Utilities Kingston

EXHIBITS ATTACHED: _
Schedule A - Tender No. LO4-FCP-FIN 2008-3, Winter Control for Municipal Parking Lots, Buildings and Facilities

Y

(
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SCHEDULE A to Report 08-347
Tender NO. L04-FCP-FIN 2008-3
Winter Control for Municipal Parking Lots, Building and Facilities

APPENDIX A - PART ONE
MUNICIPAL PARKING LOTS

Harrison Excavating &
Pipeline Ltd

Zomer & Son’s
Landscaping

Bayridge Landscaping

~ $100.00/hr

$65.00/hr

$95.00/hr

NB

$120.00/hr

NB

$120.00/hr

$65.00/hr

$110.00/hr

NB

$95.00/hr

NB

$60.00/hr

NB

$750
$775
$825

No Bid

2006/07 Price
$65.00/hr Plow
$55/hr % ton
$80.00/hr Loader
$70.00/hr Backhoe
$60.00/hr Skid Steer zzzkr;?e
$48.50/hr Labour Ic oteer
Labour
Pricing Per Occasion for
Snow Control. LOT
2006/07 Prices 14
$600 15
$500 16
$675
Pricing per Occasion for
Trucking of Snow
2007/08 Prices LOT
$470 1
$530 2
$500 3
$425 4
$675 5
$350 6
$395 7
$800 8
$650 9
$800 10
$425 11
$625 12
$250 13
$600 14

$5200
$5200
$2752
$2808
$2127
$1090
$829
$1930
$828
- $6500
$2250
$772
$575
$1575

No Bid
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APPENDIX B

Zomer & Son’s

$55.00/occasion

. Harrison Ei(cavating . Bayridge Lawns Sharpe Lawn
PART TWO (A) Landscaping & e GLE Excavation p
BUILDINGS & PROPERTIES Contracting Ltd & Pipeline Ltd & Landscaping & Garden
Utilities Building
2006/07 Price gg:} ! 'S“e‘;“s';‘ 6 ggszgggmth No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 15,000 Seasonal ’
Transit Building
2006/7 Price 88::; ;ne(;r;tgnx 6 ggf ggi)mth No Bid No Bid No Bid
$13,200 Seasonal ’
Kingston East Landfill
Site Cost/ month x 6 $1,500/mth No Bid No Bid No Bid
2006/07 Price - Cost/ season $9,000
$3,800.00 Season
Brewers Mills
Fire Hall # 2 Cost/ month x 6 . $1,000/mth . .
2006/07 Price Cost/ season No Bid $6,000 No Bid No Bid
$1,950 Season
Unity Road
Fire Hall 4 8 Cost/ month x 6 . $1,250/mth . .
2006/07 Price Cost/ season No Bid $7,500 No Bid No Bid
$3,900 Season
Hwy 38 . )
Fire Hall # 9 Cost/ month x 6 No Bid $ 1,250/mth . .
2006/07 Price Cost/ season $7,500 No Bid No Bid
$3,540 Season
Kingston Area
Recycling Centre Cost/ month x 6 $3,500/mth No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Cost/ season $21,000 ol ot o el
2006/07 Price ! :
1 $10,500 Season
Court House
2006/07 Price 8225?::;2: 6 23638%”““ No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5,000 Season ’
Water Treatment
2006/07 Price Cost/Occassion $250 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,650 Season
MacLachlan Museum X !
2006/07 Price Sostinonth x6 gé%%oémm No Bid No Bid No Bid
$75.00/occasion !
Pump House Museum
. Cost/month x 6 $1,000/mth . .
No Pricing for 06/07 Cost/Season No Bid $6,000 No Bid No Bid
The Grand Theatre
Cost/month x 6 . $1,500/mth .
No Pricing for 06/07  ; Cost/Season No id $9,000 No Bid
Kingston Memorial
Centre .
2006/07 Price ggﬁg%cgﬁt'"”
$450-Occasion Plow Track/Oce No Bid No Bid No Bid
$90 Sand & Salt ’
$300 Track
Woodburn Community
Centre . :
. Cost/Occasion . $300
2006/07 Price Sand & Salt No Bid $150 No Bid No Bid




